COUNTY OF ULSTER
Michael P. Hein
County Executive

ULSTER COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Robin L. Peruso, CPPB

Director of Purchasing
CONTRACT AWARD INFORMATION
Title: HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS
Bid No.: RFB-UCI14-03

Contract Period: APRIL 1, 2014 - MARCH 31, 2015

Authorized Users: COUNTY OF ULSTER DEPARTMENTS, POLITICAL
SUBDIVISIONS AND OTHERS AUTHORIZED BY LAW

View Specifications at: http://www.empirestatebidsystem.com/

Submit Inquiries to:

Name: JAMES WERNER, PRINCIPAL BUYER
Phone: 845-340-3408
Fax: 845-340-3434
Email: jweri@co.ulster.ny.us
BID DESCRIPTION

The purpose of this bid is to establish a price for the purchase of Highway Signs
and Blanks, Sign Posts, Culvert Pipe and related Highway Materials for
procurement by the Ulster County Department of Public Works / Highways and
Bridges as needed during the contract period.

BID AWARD CONTRACT # VENDOR INFORMATION Phone/Fax/Email
NAME/ADDRESS/CONTACT

Primary Vendor:

------ MULTIPLE VENDORS ------ SEE MEMO ATTACHED




Bid #UC14-03 Highways Signs and Materials Bid Award and Vendor List
Contract effective through March 31, 2015

Expanded Supply Products
3330 Route 9

Cold Spring, NY 10516
Contact: Charlie Kehr

Ph: 845-265-3771

Fax: 845-265-3772

Chemung Supply Corp.
P.O. Box 527

Elmira, NY 14902
Contact: Carl Perine
Ph: 607-733-5506

Fax: 607-732-5379

Spinnenweber PFV LLC
P.O. Box 1819

Kingston, NY 12401
Contact: Jack Spinnenweber
Ph: 845-331-7473

Fax: 845-340-7381

Vulcan Signs

P.O. Box 1850

Foley, AL 36536-1850
Contact: Matthew Maurin
Ph: 800-633-6845
Fax:251-943-1544

Allmac Signs

10 Captain Scott Rd.
Harwich, MA 02645
Contact: Ron Whitaker
Ph: 413-241-6916
Fax: 413-241-6918

Schmidt Wholesale Inc.
PO Box 5100

Monticello, NY 12701
Contact: Rick Innella
Ph: 845-794-5900 x8028
Fax: 845-794-6142

HD Supply Waterworks, LTD
14 Arch Street

Watervliet, NY 12189
Contact: Brian robinson

Ph: 518-320-5023
Fax:855-214-6436

American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc.
P.O. Box 1449

Orange Park, FL 32067

Contact: Anna Cristodero

Ph: 877-872-2876

Fax:904-284-8165

Eberl Iron Works, Inc.
128 Sycamore Street
Buffalo, NY 14204
Contact: Gregory Jones
Ph: 716-854-7633

Fax: 716-854-1184

Garden State Highway Products, Inc.
1740 E. Oak Road

Vineland, NJ 08361

Contact: Sharon Green

Ph: 856-692-7572

Fax: 856-692-6797




HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03

SECTION 'A" - SIGNS

ITEM # ITEM NAME
1 DELINEATOR SIGNS YELLOW SIGN-
H. I. PRISMATIC
2 DELINEATOR SIGNS WHITE SIGN- H.
I. PRISMATIC
3 DELINEATOR POSTS X 6 FOOT
4 DELINEATOR POSTS X 6 FOOT
5 TRAFFIC SIGN POSTS
6 TRAFFIC SIGN POSTS
7 TRAFFIC SIGN POSTS
8 LAP-SPLICE FASTENING HARDWARE
9 1 # PREPUNCHED ALUMINUM Z-BAR
10 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
11 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
12 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
13 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
14 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
15 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
16 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
17 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
18 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
19 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
20 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
21 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
22 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
23 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
24 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
25 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
26 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
27 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD A

AWARD LIST - A
TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15

BY ITEM
SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE UNIT
4in X 4in W/5/16in Center $110.00 PER/100
Hole
4in X 4in W/5/16in Center $110.00 PER/100
Hole
1.33# PER LINEAR $6.58 EACH
FOOT
1.12 # PER LINEAR $6.08 EACH
FOOT
2# PER LINEAR FOOT $1.19 L.F.
3# PER LINEAR FOOT $1.79 L.F.
4# PER LINEAR FOOT $2.38 L.F.
BREAKAWAY $4.53 SET/2
5/16" HOLES, 1" ON $80.80 EACH
CENTER 16 FT.
6in X 6in $0.85 EACH
8in X 8in $1.15 EACH
12in X 6in $1.32 EACH
12in X 9in $1.65 EACH
12in X 18in $3.07 EACH
12in X 20in $3.39 EACH
12in X 24in $4.07 EACH
12in X 54in $9.16 EACH
18in X 6in $1.53 EACH
18in X 10in $2.55 EACH
18in X 18in $4.58 EACH
24in X 6in $2.04 EACH
24in X 8in $2.71 EACH
24in X 10in $3.39 EACH
24in X 18in $6.11 EACH
24in X 24in $8.14 EACH
24in X 30in $10.18 EACH
24in X 36in $12.21 EACH
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VENDOR

VULCAN SIGNS

VULCAN SIGNS
CHEMUNG SUPPLY
CHEMUNG SUPPLY
CHEMUNG SUPPLY
CHEMUNG SUPPLY
CHEMUNG SUPPLY

GARDEN STATE

EBERL IRION WORKS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

VULCAN SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

COUNTY OF ULSTER



HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03
BY ITEM

SECTION 'A" - SIGNS

ITEM # ITEM NAME
28 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
29 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
30 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
31 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
32 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
33 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
34 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
35 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
36 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
37 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
38 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
39 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
40 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
41 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
42 TRAFFIC SIGN BLANK
43 STOP SIGN OCTAGON BLANK
44 STOP SIGN OCTAGON BLANK
45 STOP SIGN OCTAGON BLANK
46 STOP SIGN OCTAGON BLANK
a7 YIELD EQUI-TRIANGLE SIGN BLANK
48 YIELD EQUI-TRIANGLE SIGN BLANK
49 DIAMETER CIRCLE SIGN BLANK
50 DIAMETER CIRCLE SIGN BLANK
51 PENTAGON SIGN BLANK/SCHOOL
52 PENTAGON SIGN BLANK/SCHOOL
53 PENTAGON SIGN BLANK/COUNTY
ROUTE MARKER
54 TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, PRESSURE

SENSITIVE

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD A

AWARD LIST - A
TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15

SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE  UNIT
30in X 30in $12.72 EACH
30in X 36in $15.26 EACH
36in X 12in $6.11 EACH
36in X 18in $9.16 EACH
36in X 24in $12.21 EACH
36in X 36in $18.32 EACH
40in X 30in $16.96 EACH
48in X 18in $12.21 EACH
48in X 24in $16.28 EACH
48in X 30in $20.35 EACH
48in X 36in $24.42 EACH
48in X 48in $32.56 EACH
60in X 24in $20.35 EACH
60in X 30in $25.44 EACH
96in X 60in $81.40 EACH
24in $7.71 EACH
30in $12.07 EACH
36in $17.47 EACH
48in $30.98 EACH
36in $8.88 EACH
48in $15.79 EACH
30in $12.31 EACH
36in $16.86 EACH
30in X 30in $11.81 EACH
36in X 36in $16.85 EACH
24in X 24in M4-1 $8.48 EACH
6in X 6in $0.37 EACH
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VENDOR
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
ALLMAC SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS

ALLMAC SIGNS

VULCAN SIGNS

COUNTY OF ULSTER



HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03

ITEM #
55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80

81

SECTION 'A" - SIGNS
ITEM NAME

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN BUS STOP AHEAD

PRESSURE SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD A

AWARD LIST - A
TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15

BY ITEM

SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE UNIT
8in X 8in $0.66 EACH
12in X 6in $0.75 EACH
12in X 9in $1.12 EACH
12in X 18in $2.24 EACH
12in X 20in $2.47 EACH
12in X 24in $2.96 EACH
12in X 54in $6.69 EACH
18in X 6in $1.12 EACH
18in X 10in $1.86 EACH
18in X 18in $3.32 EACH
24in X 6in $1.49 EACH
24in X 8in $1.99 EACH
24in X 10in $2.48 EACH
24in X 18in $4.47 EACH
24in X 24in $5.96 EACH
24in X 30in $7.41 EACH
24in X 36in $8.89 EACH
30in X 30in $9.26 EACH
30in X 30in $19.42 EACH
Fluorescent Yellow

30in X 36in $11.11 EACH
36in X 12in $4.47 EACH
36in X 18in $6.67 EACH
36in X 24in $8.89 EACH
36in X 36in $13.33 EACH
40in X 30in $12.41 EACH
48in X 18in $8.89 EACH
48in X 24in $11.85 EACH
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VENDOR
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
VULCAN SIGNS
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
VULCAN SIGNS
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

COUNTY OF ULSTER



HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03

ITEM #
82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
90
91
92
93

94

95

96
97
98
99
100
101
102
103
104
105
106

107

SECTION 'A" - SIGNS
ITEM NAME

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

STOP SIGN OCTAGON FACE
PRESSURE SENSITIVE, DIAMOND
STOP SIGN OCTAGON FACE
PRESSURE SENSITIVE, DIAMOND
STOP SIGN OCTAGON FACE
PRESSURE SENSITIVE, DIAMOND
YIELD EQUI-TRIANGLE SIGN FACE
PRESSURE SENSITIVE

YIELD EQUI-TRIANGLE SIGN FACE
PRESSURE SENSITIVE

DIAMETER CIRCLE SIGN FACE
PRESSURE SENSITIVE

DIAMETER CIRCLE SIGN FACE
PRESSURE SENSITIVE
PENTAGON SIGN FACE,
SCHOOL/PEDESTRIAN, PRESSURE
SENSITIVE, DIAMOND GRADE
PENTAGON SIGN FACE,
SCHOOL/PEDESTRIAN, PRESSURE
SENSITIVE, DIAMOND GRADE

PENTAGON SIGN FACE/COUNTY
ROUTE MARKER PRESSURE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3272, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3272, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3272, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3272, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3277, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3277, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3277, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3277, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3290, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3290, PRESSURE SENSITIVE
FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE
#3290, PRESSURE SENSITIVE

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD A

AWARD LIST - A
TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15

BY ITEM
SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE UNIT
48in X 30in $14.82 EACH
48in X 36in $17.78 EACH
48in X 48in $23.71 EACH
60in X 24in $14.82 EACH
96in X 60in $59.60 EACH
30in / Red $19.00 EACH
36in / Red $27.36 EACH
48in / Red $48.64 EACH
36in $6.04 EACH
48in $12.70 EACH
30in $9.26 EACH
36in $13.33 EACH
30in X 30in $19.42 EACH
Flourescent Yellow
Green
36in X 36in $27.96 EACH
Flourescent Yellow
Green
24in X 24in M4-1 $6.31 EACH
3/8in x 50 yds RED $3.70 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
1/2in x 50 yds RED $4.94 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
5/8in x 50 yds RED $6.17 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
3/4in x 50 yds RED $7.41 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
3/8in x 50 yds GREEN $3.70 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
1/2in x 50 yds GREEN $4.94 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
5/8in x 50 yds GREEN $6.17 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
3/4in x 50 yds GREEN $7.41 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
3/8in x 50 yds WHITE $3.70 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
1/2in x 50 yds WHITE $4.94 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
5/8in x 50 yds WHITE $6.17 ROLL
REFLECTIVE

SECTION A Page 4 of 7

VENDOR
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
GARDEN STATE
GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS

VULCAN SIGNS

COUNTY OF ULSTER



HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03

ITEM #
108
109
110

111
112

113
114
115
116
117
118
119
120
121
122
123
124
125
126
127
128
129
130
131
132
133

134

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD A

SECTION 'A" - SIGNS

ITEM NAME

FACING, ENGINEERING GRADE

#3290, PRESSURE SENSITIVE

FACING, SCOTCH-CAL #3650-12,

PRESSURE SENSITIVE

FACING, SCOTCH-CAL #3650-12,

PRESSURE SENSITIVE

FACING, SCOTCH-CAL #3650-12,

PRESSURE SENSITIVE

ROLLED GOODS SERIES 3930,

PRESSURE SENSITIVE, HIGH

ROLLED GOODS #3650-10 WHT, 3650-
12 BLK,- PRESSURE SENSITIVE

ROLLED GOODS SERIES 3934
PRESSURE SENSITIVE,HIGH

ROLLED GOODS, WORK ZONE
SHEETING, E.G. SERIES CW46,

ROLLED GOODS SERIES 3930

334/336 L/R PRESSURE SENSITIVE

ROLLED GOODS SERIES 7725

BLK/WHT - PRESSURE SENSITIVE
SIGN POST REFLECTIVE STRIPS,
DIAMOND GRADE, BRITESIDE
SIGN POST REFLECTIVE STRIPS,
DIAMOND GRADE, BRITESIDE

TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED

TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED

AWARD LIST - A
TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15

BY ITEM
SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE  UNIT
3/4in x 50 yds WHITE $7.41 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
3/8in x 50 yds BLACK $3.94 ROLL
NON-REFLECTIVE
5/8in x 50 yds BLACK $6.56 ROLL
NON-REFLECTIVE
3/4in x 50 yds BLACK $7.88 ROLL
NON-REFLECTIVE
30in X 50 YDS. PRESS.  $489.47 ROLL
SENSITIVE
30in X 50 YDS. NON- $179.63 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
30in X 50 YDS. $489.47 ROLL
REFLECTIVE , ORANGE
7in X 50 YDS. $68.25 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
7in X 50 YDS. $133.00 ROLL
REFLECTIVE, HIGH
30in X 50 YDS. NON- $311.25 ROLL
REFLECTIVE
3in X 72in, RED $14.75 EACH
3in X 72in, YELLOW $14.75 EACH
6in X 6in $1.29 EACH
8in X 8in $2.08 EACH
12in X 6in $2.17 EACH
12in X 9in $2.91 EACH
12in X 18in $5.51 EACH
12in X 20in $6.67 EACH
12in X 24in $7.43 EACH
12in X 54in $16.43 EACH
18in X 6in $2.91 EACH
18in X 10in $5.06 EACH
18in X 18in $8.48 EACH
24in X 6in $3.87 EACH
24in X 8in $5.14 EACH
24in X 10in $6.30 EACH
24in X 18in $10.98 EACH
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VENDOR
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS

VULCAN SIGNS
GARDEN STATE

AMERICAN TRAFFIC
GARDEN STATE
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
GARDEN STATE
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
GARDEN STATE
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS

VULCAN SIGNS

COUNTY OF ULSTER



HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03

ITEM #
135
136
137
138
139
140
141
142
143
144
145
146
147
148
149
150
151
152
153
154
155

156

157

158

159

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD A

SECTION 'A" - SIGNS

ITEM NAME
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED,
MULTICOLOR
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED,
MULTICOLOR
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED
TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED

TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED

TRAFFIC SIGN, ASSEMBLED

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, STOP SIGN

OCTAGON FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE, DIAMOND GRADE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, STOP SIGN

OCTAGON FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE, DIAMOND GRADE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, STOP SIGN

OCTAGON FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE, DIAMOND GRADE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, YIELD EQUI-
TRIANGLE SIGN FACE PRESSURE

SENSITIVE

AWARD LIST - A

BY ITEM

SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE UNIT
24in X 24in $14.60 EACH
24in X 30in $18.25 EACH
24in X 36in $21.90 EACH
30in X 30in $22.81 EACH
30in X 30in $33.02 EACH
Fluorescent Yellow

30in X 30in $24.04 EACH
30in X 36in $27.38 EACH
36in X 12in $10.95 EACH
36in X 18in $16.43 EACH
36in X 24in $21.90 EACH
36in X 36in $32.85 EACH
36in X 36in $34.05 EACH
40in X 30in $30.42 EACH
48in X 18in $21.90 EACH
48in X 24in $29.20 EACH
48in X 30in $36.50 EACH
48in X 36in $43.80 EACH
48in X 48in $58.40 EACH
60in X 24in $36.50 EACH
60in X 30in $45.63 EACH
96in X 60in $146.00 EACH
30in / Red $19.42 EACH
36in / Red $27.96 EACH
48in / Red $49.71 EACH
36in $6.62 EACH
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TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15

VENDOR
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS
VULCAN SIGNS

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

COUNTY OF ULSTER



HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03

161

162

163

164

165

SECTION 'A" - SIGNS
ITEM NAME

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, YIELD EQUI-
TRIANGLE SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, DIAMETER
CIRCLE SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, DIAMETER
CIRCLE SIGN FACE PRESSURE
SENSITIVE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, PENTAGON,
SCHOOL /PEDESTRIAN, PRESSURE
SENS., DIAMOND GRADE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, PENTAGON,
SCHOOL /PEDESTRIAN, PRESSURE
SENS., DIAMOND GRADE

TRAFFIC SIGN FACE, PENTAGON,
COUNTY ROUTE MARKER
PRESSURE SENSITIVE

AWARD LIST - A
TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15

BY ITEM
SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE UNIT
48in $13.91 EACH
30in $9.26 EACH
36in $13.33 EACH
30in X 30in $19.42 EACH
Flourescent Yellow
Green
36in X 36in $27.96 EACH
Flourescent Yellow
Green
24in X 24in M4-1 $6.22 EACH

VENDOR

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

GARDEN STATE

CONTINUED IN SECTION "B" WITH PIPE AND CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS!!

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD A
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HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03
SECTION 'B' - PIPE

ITEM ITEM NAME

Zh:‘

200 GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND

GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND
GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - ROUND

GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE - RD BAND

201

202

203

204

205

206

207

208

209

210

211

212

213

214

215

216

217

218

219

220

ROUND

221
ROUND

222
ROUND

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD B

GALVANIZED END SECTIONS -

GALVANIZED END SECTIONS -

GALVANIZED END SECTIONS -

BY ITEM
SIZE/DESCRIPTION

AWARD LIST - B
TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15

8in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE PIPE

8in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE BAND

12in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE PIPE

12in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE BAND

15in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE PIPE

15in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE BAND

18in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE PIPE

18in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE BAND

21in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE PIPE

21in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE BAND

24in DIAMETER, 15 GAUGE PIPE

24in DIAMETER, 15 GAUGE BAND

30in DIAMETER, 14 GAUGE PIPE

30in DIAMETER, 14 GAUGE BAND

36in DIAMETER, 14 GAUGE PIPE

36in DIAMETER, 14 GAUGE BAND

42in DIAMETER, 14 GAUGE PIPE

42in DIAMETER, 14 GAUGE BAND

48in DIAMETER, 12 GAUGE PIPE

48in DIAMETER, 12 GAUGE BAND

12in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE

15in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE

18in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE

PRICE UNIT
6.08 FOOT
6.08 BAND
7.08 FOOT
7.08 BAND
9.30 FOOT
9.30 BAND

11.22 FOOT
11.22 BAND
14.30 FOOT
14.30 BAND
15.45 FOOT
15.45 BAND
2428 FOOT
2428 BAND
29.75 FOOT
29.75 BAND
35.65 FOOT
53.35 BAND
52.05 FOOT
77.95 BAND
50.85 EACH
65.50 EACH
86.60 EACH
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VENDOR
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
SPINNENWEBER PFV
SPINNENWEBER PFV
SPINNENWEBER PFV
SPINNENWEBER PFV
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
SPINNENWEBER PFV
SPINNENWEBER PFV
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS

HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS

COUNTY OF ULSTER



ITEM
#
223

224

225

226

227

228

229

230

231

232

233

234

235

236

237

238

239

240

241

242

243

244

HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03

SECTION 'B' - PIPE

ITEM NAME

GALVANIZED END SECTIONS -
ROUND

GALVANIZED END SECTIONS -
ROUND

GALVANIZED END SECTIONS -
ROUND

GALVANIZED END SECTIONS -
ROUND

GALVANIZED END SECTIONS -
ROUND

GALVANIZED END SECTIONS -
ROUND

GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE -
PERFORATED

GALVANIZED CORRUGATED
CULVERT PIPE -
PERFORATED
POLYETHYLENE PIPE W/BELL
END

POLYETHYLENE PIPE BAND

POLYETHYLENE PIPE W/BELL
END

POLYETHYLENE PIPE BAND

POLYETHYLENE PIPE W/BELL
END

POLYETHYLENE PIPE BAND

POLYETHYLENE PIPE W/BELL
END

POLYETHYLENE PIPE BAND

POLYETHYLENE PIPE W/BELL
END

POLYETHYLENE PIPE BAND

POLYETHYLENE PIPE W/BELL
END

POLYETHYLENE PIPE BAND

ABS COMPOSITE PIPE 8"
DIAMETER

ABS COMPOSITE PIPE 10in
DIAMETER

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD B

BY ITEM
SIZE/DESCRIPTION

AWARD LIST - B

TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15

21in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE

24in DIAMETER, 16 GAUGE

30in DIAMETER, 14 GAUGE

36in DIAMETER, 14 GAUGE

42in DIAMETER, 14 GAUGE

48in DIAMETER, 12 GAUGE

6in DIAMETER - PIPE

6in DIAMETER - BAND

12in DIAMETER, 45 PSI - PIPE

12in DIAMETER, 45 PSI - BAND

15in DIAMETER, 42 PSI - PIPE

15in DIAMETER, 42 PSI - BAND

18in DIAMETER, 40 PSI - PIPE

18in DIAMETER, 40 PSI - BAND

24in DIAMETER, 34 PSI - PIPE

24in DIAMETER, 34 PSI - BAND

30in DIAMETER, 28 PSI - PIPE

30in DIAMETER, 28 PSI - BAND

36in DIAMETER, 22 PSI - PIPE

36in DIAMETER, 22 PSI - BAND

9.4" APPROX O.D., 7LB/FT

APPROX WEIGHT

11.8in APPROX O.D., 9 LB/FT
APPROX WEIGHT

PRICE UNIT VENDOR
117.20 EACH HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
133.35 EACH HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
307.75 EACH HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
419.25 EACH HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
597.00 EACH CHEMUNG SUPPLY
962.75 EACH HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
4.84 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
4.84 BAND CHEMUNG SUPPLY
4.64 FOOT SCHMIDT'S
4.64 BAND HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
599 FOOT HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
5.99 BAND CHEMUNG SUPPLY
8.89 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
8.89 BAND EXPANDED SUPPLY PROD
13.94 FOOT HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
13.94 BAND CHEMUNG SUPPLY
19.94 FOOT SCHMIDT'S
19.94 BAND SCHMIDT'S
25.99 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
25.99 BAND CHEMUNG SUPPLY
NO BID FOOT NO BID
NO BID FOOT NO BID

SECTION B Page 2 of 5

COUNTY OF ULSTER



HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03 AWARD LIST - B

SECTION 'B' - PIPE BY ITEM TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15
ITEM ITEM NAME SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE UNIT VENDOR

#

245 ABS COMPOSITE PIPE 12in 13.1in APPROX O.D., 14 LB/FT NO BID FOOT NO BID
DIAMETER APPROX WEIGHT

246 ABS COMPOSITE PIPE 15in 17.7in APPROX O.D., 23 LB/FT NO BID FOOT NO BID
DIAMETER APPROX WEIGHT

247 PERFORATED CORRUGATED 4in DIAMETER 0.38 FOOT SCHMIDT'S
POLYETHYLENE UNDERDRAIN
TUBING

248 PERFORATED CORRUGATED 6in DIAMETER 0.88 FOOT SCHMIDT'S
POLYETHYLENE UNDERDRAIN
TUBING

249 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 10in DIAMETER - NEW NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

250 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 12in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

251 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 14in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

252 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 16in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

253 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 18in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

254 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 20in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

255 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 22in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

256 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 24in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

257 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 26in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

258 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 30in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

259 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 32in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

260 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 36in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

261 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 38in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

262 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 43in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

263 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 48in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

264 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 54in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

265 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 60in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW
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HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03 AWARD LIST - B

SECTION 'B' - PIPE BY ITEM TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15
ITEM ITEM NAME SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE UNIT VENDOR

#

266 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 66in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

267 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 72in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

268 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 78in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

269 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 84in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

270 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 90in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

271 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 96in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
NEW

272 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 10in DIAMETER - USED 22.10 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

273 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 12in DIAMETER 25.98 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

274 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 14in DIAMETER 28,54 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

275 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 16in DIAMETER 30.83 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

276 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 18in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
USED

277 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 20in DIAMETER 38.44 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

278 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 22in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
USED

279 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 24in DIAMETER 48.08 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

280 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 26in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
USED

281 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 30in DIAMETER 80.82 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

282 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 32in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
USED

283 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 36in DIAMETER 97.12 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

284 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 38in DIAMETER NO BID FOOT NO BID
USED

285 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 42in DIAMETER 137.34 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

286 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 48in DIAMETER 223.92 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

287 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 54in DIAMETER 255.04 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED

288 HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE - 60in DIAMETER 267.34 FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY
USED
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ITEM
#
289

290

201

292

293

294

295

296

297

298

299

300

301

302

HIGHWAY SIGNS AND MATERIALS BID #14-03

SECTION 'B' - PIPE
ITEM NAME

HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE -
USED

HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE -
USED

HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE -
USED

HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE -
USED

HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE -
USED

HEAVY STEEL CULVERT PIPE -
USED

GABION BASKETS
GABION BASKETS
NON-WOVEN FABRIC
NON-WOVEN FABRIC
WOVEN FABRIC
WOVEN FABRIC

USED STEEL OPEN GRATE
DECKING

USED STEEL OPEN GRATE
NDFCKING

AWARD LIST - B
TERM: 4/1/14 - 3/31/15
UNIT VENDOR

BY ITEM

SIZE/DESCRIPTION PRICE
66in DIAMETER 291.69
72in DIAMETER 344.38
78in DIAMETER 370.00
84in DIAMETER 379.90
90in DIAMETER 401.37
96in DIAMETER 457.42

1.5ft X 3ft X6ft 45.48

3ft X 3ft X 6ft 66.24

12ft - 6in X 360 FT. ROLL 0.479

15ft - Oin X 360 FT. ROLL 0.479

12ft - 6in X 432 FT. ROLL 0.419

17ft - 6in X 309 FT. ROLL 0.419

2 1/2in THICK DECKING 45.60

5in THICK DECKING 54.85

SEE SECTION "A" FOR SIGNS AND BLANKS

S/PURCH/BIDS2014/14-03 AWARD B

SECTION B Page 50f5

FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY

FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY

FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY

FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY

FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY

FOOT CHEMUNG SUPPLY

EACH EXPANDED SUPPLY PROD
EACH EXPANDED SUPPLY PROD
SQ. YD.CHEMUNG SUPPLY
SQ. YD.CHEMUNG SUPPLY
SQ. YD.CHEMUNG SUPPLY
SQ. YD.CHEMUNG SUPPLY

SQ. FT. CHEMUNG SUPPLY

SQ. FT. CHEMUNG SUPPLY
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