
COUNTY OF ULSTER 
Patrick K. Ryan  

County Executive 

 
 
 
 
 

ULSTER COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
ED JORDAN 

Director of Purchasing 
 

CONTRACT AWARD INFORMATION 
 
 
Title:    POOL AND WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS 
 
Bid Number:    RFB-UC20-071 
 
Contract Period:   APRIL 1, 2021 - MARCH 31, 2022 
 
Possible Extensions:  NONE 
 
Authorized Users:   DPW, HEALTH 
 
View Specifications at:   http://www.empirestatebidsystem.com/ 
 
Submit Inquiries to: 
 
Name:  Fiona Bohan 
 
Phone: 845-334-5574 
 
Fax:  845-340-3434   
 
Email: fboh@co.ulster.ny.us 
 

 
DESCRIPTION 

 
The purpose of this bid is to establish a price for the purchase and delivery of Pool & Water 
Treatment Chemicals by the County of Ulster and municipalities within Ulster County. 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

http://www.empirestatebidsystem.com/
mailto:fboh@co.ulster.ny.us


 
 

 

AWARDED 
VENDORS 

 

NAME/ ADDRESS/ 
CONTACT 

 

Phone/Fax/Email 

AMREX CHEMICAL 
COMPANY INC 

SUSAN BENTLEY 
117 E FREDERICK ST 

BINGHAMTON, NY 13902 

P: 607-772-8784 
F: 607-772-8786 
E: SUSAN@AMREXCHEMICAL.COM 

SURPASS 
CHEMICAL 

COMPANY INC 

MICHELLE O’DELL 
1254 BROADWAY 

ALBANY, NY 12204 

P: 518-434-8101 
F: 518-434-8135 
E: CUSTOMERSERVICE@SURPASSCHEMICAL.COM  

 
    
 AWARD BY ITEM   

ITEM 
# DESCRIPTION PRICE AWARD 

1 
Sodium Hypochlorite 15% Bulk Delivery 2" Quick Disconnect - 

NSF or UL Approved only - Price per Gallon - reference 
Section 30 of specifications for estimated usage 

$0.98 SURPASS 

2 AquaPerl PERLITE   Bag Size 12 LB $14.58 SURPASS 
3 ACCU - TAB  3"  Tablets  55 LB Container $145.00 AMREX 

4 15 Gal Drum Sodium Hypochlorite 15% $17.25 AMREX 
  Container Deposit for item #4 $25.00 AMREX 
5 15 Gal Drum Muriatic Acid $24.65 SURPASS 
  Container Deposit for item #5 $40.00 SURPASS 
6 5 Gal Drum Muriatic Acid $25.00 AMREX 

 Container Deposit for item #6 $8.00 AMREX 
7 5 Gal Sodium Hypochlorite $6.50 SURPASS 

 Container Deposit for item #7 $8.00 SURPASS 
8 55 Gal Sodium Hypochlorite $63.25 AMREX 

 Container Deposit for item #8 $35.00 AMREX 
9 100/bx DPD #1R Tablets $13.00 SURPASS 

10 1000/bx DPD #1R Tablets $60.00 SURPASS 
11 100/bx DPD #3 RAPID TABLETS $13.00 SURPASS 
12 1000/bx DPD #3 RAPID TABLETS $60.00 SURPASS 
13 100/bx DPD Phenol Red Tablets $13.00 SURPASS 
14 1000/bx DPD Phenol Red Tablets $60.00 SURPASS 
15 100/bxDPD Alkalinity Tablets $13.00 SURPASS 
16 Calcium Chloride Flaked 50 LB Bag $12.00 AMREX 
17 Calcium Chloride Flaked 100 LB Bag $24.00 AMREX 
18 100/bx Calcium Hardness Tablets $13.00 SURPASS 

19 Sodium Thiosulfate 50 LB Bag $20.00 AMREX 



20 Light Soda Ash 50 LB Bag $18.00 AMREX 
21 YIL Brand Ph Plus-(4x10 LB/case) $33.00 SURPASS 
22 Muriatic Acid - 4/1 Gal/case $15.00 SURPASS 

23 Sodium Bicarbonate 50 LB Bag $15.00 AMREX 
24 Yil Brand LO-N-slow PH Decreaser-12x2.50#/case $39.75 AMREX 
25 LP-3 Test Kit Chlorine PH $116.00 SURPASS 
26 PM-41 Test Kit Pool Test Kit $78.75 SURPASS 
27 Test Tubes - 10 ml $4.00 AMREX 
28 3366NJ Test Kit $78.75 SURPASS 
29 Algaecide (4/1 gal./cs.) $23.50 SURPASS 

30 
Phenol Red Indicator Solution 100ml (Hach Chemicals 
item#21132) NO BID   

31 Bioguard Pool Magnet Quart Bottles (or equal) $7.50 SURPASS 
32 LaMotte 2056 Color Q Pro 7 Digital Pool Water Test Kit $189.00 SURPASS 
33 3428 Slidebar ( 0.5 - 10 ) $20.00 AMREX 

34 
Hach Permachem Reagents-DPD Free Chlorine Reagent 1000 
foil pillows/pk NO BID   

35 LaMotte Color Q PRO 7 Reagent Refill R2056 $71.95 SURPASS 
36 HACH 5870000 Pocket Colorimeter NO BID   

37 
LaMotte DPD Free, Total, Combined Chlorine Test Kit (3308-
01)   $78.00 SURPASS 

38 LaMotte Octify Bars - CL 3401-01 $25.00 SURPASS 
39 Water Clarifier - Quart Bottle (use rate 2 oz. per 10,000 gals.) $11.43 SURPASS 
40 Sodium Bisulfate (Dry Acid) 50 LB Bag $27.00 AMREX 

41 
Hach Permachem Reagents Ferrover Iron Reagent 10ml 
pk/100 Mfr #21057-69 NO BID   

42 3404 LaMotte Slidebar (1.0 - 6.0) $25.00 SURPASS 
43 2977 LaMotte Insta-Test 5 Plus (50) NO BID   

 


